
BID ABSTRACT 

General Contractor Bid Item A 

BCS, LLC. NO BID 

CT General Contractors, LLC NO BID 

Dominguez Design-Build NO BID 

Hale Building Company $ 2,402,2 14.00 

Saga Construction, LLC NO BID 

Trawick Contractors, Inc $ 3,157,700.00 

Wyatt General Contractor, Inc NO BID 

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED AND READ ALL 
OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT I HAVE VERIFIED THE 

ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT CORRECT 

August 29, 2024 

FMTC BUILDING 1001 (DINING FACILITY) RENOVATIONS 
Anniston, AL 

IFB # AC-24-B-0053-S 
29-Aug-24 

Alternate A1 Alternate A2 Alternate A3 Alternate A4 

$ 1,559,065.00 $ 15,116.00 $ 124,706.00 $ 47,672.00 

$ 1,432,000.00 $ 15,000.00 $ 144,000.00 $ 12,500.00 

Bid Item B 

$ 636,760.00 

$ 272,500.00 

Alternate B1 Alternate B2 

$ 11,912.00 $ 23,653.00 

$ 5,000.00 $ 653,300.00 

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE THIS DATE 
WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE ABOVE 

BIDS 

Augusl29, 2024 




