

**BID ABSTRACT**

**TALLASSEE RESTORATION**

Tallassee, AL  
 IFB # AC-21-B-0015-S  
 24-Jun-21

General Contractor	BID ITEM A	ALTERNATE A1	BID ITEM B	BID ITEM C	BID ITEM D
Bullard-Cook, Inc.	NO BID				
Carmon Construction	\$ 6,048,844.00	\$ 277,000.00	\$ 16,500.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 298,000.00
Frasier-Ousley Construction	NO BID				
Hale Building Company	\$ 4,770,301.00	\$ 488,103.00	\$ 26,363.00	\$ 61,572.00	\$ 356,818.00
Holley-Henley Builders, Inc.	\$ 5,026,900.00	\$ 328,800.00	\$ 11,800.00	\$ 24,100.00	\$ 171,100.00
Hutcheson Construction Company	\$ 5,350,000.00	\$ 400,000.00	\$ 10,100.00	\$ 95,200.00	\$ 55,125.00
McClain Contracting Company	NO BID				
Midwest Maintenance, Inc.	NO BID				
Pemberton, Inc.	NO BID				
Whatley Construction, LLC	\$ 4,793,000.00	\$ 371,000.00	\$ 32,500.00	\$ 39,000.00	\$ 159,000.00

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED AND READ ALL OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT I HAVE VERIFIED THE ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT CORRECT.



MARK A. WEEKS, SPDO June 24, 2021

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE THIS DATE WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE ABOVE BIDS.



Cheryl Godfrey June 24, 2021