

**BID ABSTRACT**

**FMTC TRANSIENT TRAINING BARRACKS COMPLEX**

Anniston, AL  
 IFB # AC-21-B-0004-S  
 22-Apr-21

General Contractor	BID ITEM A	Alternate A1	Alternate A2	BID ITEM B	BID ITEM C	Alternate C1	BID ITEM D	Alternate D1	Alternate D2	Alternate D3	BID ITEM E	Alternate E1
Carmon Construction, Inc.	\$ 20,498,844.00	\$ 60,000.00	\$ 75,000.00	\$ 2,089,000.00	\$ 1,871,000.00	\$ 1,681,000.00	\$ 2,316,000.00	\$ 1,158,000.00	\$ 1,158,000.00	\$ 1,158,000.00	\$ 3,670,000.00	\$ 71,000.00
Place Services, Inc.	NO BID											
RA-LIN and Associates	\$ 21,406,062.00	\$ 55,811.00	\$ 69,763.00	\$ 2,358,271.00	\$ 1,609,117.00	\$ 1,600,269.00	\$ 2,142,798.00	\$ 1,054,716.00	\$ 1,054,716.00	\$ 1,054,716.00	\$ 3,710,418.00	\$ 65,442.00
Taylor Corporation	NO BID											

General Contractor	Alternate E2	Alternate E3	Alternate E4	Alternate E5	Alternate E6	Alternate E7	Alternate E8	Alternate E9	Alternate E10	BID ITEM F	Alternate F1	Alternate F2
Carmon Construction, Inc.	\$ 435,000.00	\$ 189,000.00	\$ 50,500.00	\$ 54,000.00	\$ 48,500.00	\$ 168,000.00	\$ 131,000.00	\$ 120,000.00	\$ 250,000.00	\$ 161,000.00	\$ 310,000.00	\$ 1,790,000.00
Place Services, Inc.	NO BID											
RA-LIN and Associates	\$ 425,165.00	\$ 233,553.00	\$ 60,038.00	\$ 67,901.00	\$ 86,504.00	\$ 193,595.00	\$ 152,389.00	\$ 123,908.00	\$ 226,761.00	\$ 156,187.00	\$ 415,613.00	\$ 1,897,456.00
Taylor Corporation	NO BID											

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED AND READ ALL OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT I HAVE VERIFIED THE ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT CORRECT.



MARKA WEEKS, SPDO April 22, 2021

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE THIS DATE WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE ABOVE BIDS.



Cheryl Godfrey April 22, 2021