

BID ABSTRACT

FOLEY READINESS CENTER

Foley, Alabama
 IFB # AC-20-B-0014-S
 July 9, 2020

General Contractor	BID ITEM A	Alternate A1	Alternate A2	Alternate A3	BID ITEM B	Alternate B1	Alternate B2	BID ITEM C	Alternate C1	Alternate C2	Alternate C3	Alternate C4
Bayshore Construction Company, Inc.	NO BID											
Carmon Construction, Inc.	\$ 12,380,844.00	\$ 204,000.00	\$ 14,400.00	\$ 16,265.00	\$ 998,000.00	\$ 1,079,000.00	\$ 79,000.00	\$ 170,000.00	\$ 137,000.00	\$ 345,000.00	\$ 48,650.00	\$ 52,000.00
Cunningham Delaney Construction, LLC	\$ 12,180,000.00	\$ 275,000.00	\$ 12,000.00	\$ 13,000.00	\$ 800,000.00	\$ 500,000.00	\$ 60,000.00	\$ 140,000.00	\$ 110,000.00	\$ 330,000.00	\$ 45,000.00	\$ 21,000.00
Dunn Building Company	NO BID											
EMR, Inc.	NO BID											
Highland Wake Construction, LLC	NO BID											
Jesco, Inc.	NO BID											
Lord and Son Construction, Inc.	\$ 10,609,132.00	\$ 212,531.00	\$ 14,377.00	\$ 16,332.00	\$ 851,190.00	\$ 1,015,239.00	\$ 58,364.00	\$ 158,235.00	\$ 121,823.00	\$ 312,364.00	\$ 27,832.00	\$ 25,532.00
Lubin Enterprises, Inc.	\$ 14,954,389.00	\$ 252,796.00	\$ 5,289.00	\$ 10,086.00	\$ 1,033,310.00	\$ 1,169,717.00	\$ 70,918.00	\$ 175,684.00	\$ 110,466.00	\$ 208,835.00	\$ 87,232.00	\$ 19,066.00
Morette Company	\$ 11,450,000.00	\$ 205,000.00	\$ 5,400.00	\$ 6,200.00	\$ 1,030,000.00	\$ 932,000.00	\$ 148,000.00	\$ 191,000.00	\$ 116,000.00	\$ 352,000.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 23,500.00
MW Rogers Construction Company, LLC	NO BID											
Nearen Construction Company	\$ 10,279,000.00	\$ 203,252.00	\$ 8,519.00	\$ 9,795.00	\$ 778,524.00	\$ 972,000.00	\$ 59,000.00	\$ 182,000.00	\$ 88,000.00	\$ 312,550.00	\$ 29,000.00	\$ 27,000.00
Orocon Construction, LLC	\$ 13,020,000.00	\$ 226,000.00	\$ 5,500.00	\$ 6,500.00	\$ 1,104,000.00	\$ 1,017,000.00	\$ 60,000.00	\$ 170,000.00	\$ 120,000.00	\$ 371,000.00	\$ 41,000.00	\$ 38,000.00
Rolin Construction	NO BID											
Wyatt Sasser Construction, LLC	\$ 12,910,000.00	\$ 213,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 8,500.00	\$ 994,000.00	\$ 1,092,000.00	\$ 100,000.00	\$ 194,000.00	\$ 97,000.00	\$ 364,350.00	\$ 70,000.00	\$ 54,000.00

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED AND READ ALL OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT I HAVE VERIFIED THE ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT CORRECT.


 MARK A. WEEKS, SPOC July 9, 2020

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE THIS DATE WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE ABOVE BIDS.


 Cheryl Godfrey July 9, 2020