

BID ABSTRACT

FAIRHOPE RESTORATION

Fairhope, ALABAMA
 IFB # AC-19-B-0022-S
 5-Sep-19

General Contractor	Bid Item A	Alternate #1	Bid Item B	Alternate #1	Alternate #2
BCS, LLC	NO BID				
Bullard Cook, Inc.	\$ 711,000.00	\$ 96,000.00	\$ 210,000.00	\$ 9,500.00	\$ 29,100.00
Hale Building Company	\$ 1,171,889.00	\$ 76,174.00	\$ 381,424.00	\$ 8,752.00	\$ 21,640.00
Sycamore Construction, Inc.	NO BID				
Witherington Construction Corporation	NO BID				
Working Properties II	NO BID				
WW Compton Construction	\$ 588,140.56	\$ 72,766.25	\$ 279,891.85	\$ 7,298.00	\$ 7,655.00
Wyatt Sasser Construction, LLC	\$ 534,000.00	\$ 73,380.00	\$ 203,000.00	\$ 12,675.00	\$ 25,200.00

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED AND READ ALL OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT I HAVE VERIFIED THE ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT CORRECT.



MARK A. WEEKS, SPDO September 5, 2019

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE THIS DATE WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE ABOVE BIDS.



Cheryl Godfrey September 5, 2019