

BID ABSTRACT

Selma Restoration
 Selma, ALABAMA
 IFB # AC-19-B-0014-S
 1-Aug-19

General Contractor	Bid Item A	Alternate 1	Alternate 2	Alternate 3	Bid Item B	Alternate 1	Bid Item C
Bond Construction Company	\$ 6,879,147.00	\$ 477,124.00	\$ 4,505.00	\$ 196,185.00	\$ 83,166.00	\$ 18,185.00	\$ 396,900.00
Bullard-Cook, Inc.	NO BID						
Coburn Contractors	\$ 6,823,974.00	\$ 688,884.00	\$ 13,332.00	\$ 171,622.00	\$ 56,344.00	\$ 17,751.00	\$ 436,241.00
Frasier-Ousley Construction & Engineering, Inc.	\$ 5,693,400.00	\$ 493,300.00	\$ 7,000.00	\$ 147,700.00	\$ 49,900.00	\$ 36,800.00	\$ 368,000.00
Holley Henley Builders, Inc.	\$ 5,621,000.00	\$ 319,987.00	\$ 7,325.00	\$ 174,100.00	\$ 60,198.00	\$ 17,870.00	\$ 409,500.00
Lee Company	NO BID						
Lovelady Construction, LLC	\$ 5,828,500.00	\$ 332,600.00	\$ 5,300.00	\$ 173,300.00	\$ 55,000.00	\$ 15,500.00	\$ 349,800.00
Pemberton, Inc.	\$ 6,763,000.00	\$ 642,000.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 185,000.00	\$ 74,000.00	\$ 17,000.00	\$ 535,000.00
Steward Construction Company, Inc.	NO BID						
Structural Waterproofing & Restoration (SWR)	NO BID						
Wyatt Sasser Construction Company	\$ 6,732,400.00	\$ 317,190.00	\$ 69,840.00	\$ 170,450.00	\$ 27,645.00	\$ 13,500.00	\$ 380,240.00

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED AND READ ALL OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT I HAVE VERIFIED THE ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT CORRECT.


 MARK A. WEEKS, SPDO August 1, 2019

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE THIS DATE WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE ABOVE BIDS


 Cheryl Godfrey August 1, 2019