BID ABSTRACT

Montgomery (JFHQ) Recycle Center Renovations
Montgomery, ALABAMA
IFB # AC-17-B-0003-S

16-Mar-17
General Contractor Base Bid Alternate # Alternate #3a b#m:,_m.nm #3b Alternate #4

BCS, LLC $ 384,908.00 | § 35,085.00 | § 13,860.00 | § 36,000.00 | § 20,706.00 | $ 109,098.00
Bullard Caok Construction $ 445,000.00 | $ 38,200.00 | § 7,600.00 | & 76,600.00 | § 64,000.00 | § 105,000.00

Acoustical Contractors NO BID
Liberty Construction Co., LLC 5 403,600.00 | § 66,300.00 | 10,100.00 | § 40,500.00 | § 23,300.00 | & 94,700.00
Pemberton, Inc. NO BID
Provision Contracting Services, LLC NO BID
RDT Enterprises $ 463,786.00 | § 24,296.00 | § 8,292.00 | § ww,i a0 | $ 61,651.00| % 94,134.00
S Wright Construction NO BID
W. W, Compton Contractor $ 379,621.00 | $ 4232000 (s 9,000.00 | & 3200000 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 100,000.00
Wyatt Sasser Construction LLC § 499,368.00 | § 72,000.00 [ § 11,250.00 | $ 32,800.00 | $ 18,200.00 | § 72,000.00

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED AND
READ ALL OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT | HAVE
VERIFIED THE ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT CORRECT

MARK A WEEKS SPDO  L# March 16, 2017

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE THIS DATE
WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE ABOVE
BIDS.

Cheryl Godfrey ] March 16, 2017




