BID ABSTRACT

Dothan Restoration

Dothan, Alabama

IFB # AC-17-B-0017-S

21-Sep-17
General Contractor Base Bid Alternate #1 Alternate #2 Alternate #3
$ 1,524,615.00 108,530.00 195,750.00 | $ 92,604.00
BCS Construction
NO BID
Diversified
NO BID
Frasier-Ousley
NO BID
Gencon
$ 1,534,083.00 130,038.00 294,258.00 | $ 119,432.00
Hale Building
$ 1,689,050.00 137,750.00 487,300.00 | $ 94,000.00
Hollon Contracting
$ 1,310,000.00 150,000.00 256,000.00 | $ 110,000.00
Lewis Construction
Walters Controls NO BID
NO BID
Witherington
$ 1,551,400.00 168,000.00 172,700.00 | $ 82,000.00
Wyatt Sasser Construction

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED AND
READ ALL OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT | HAVE
VERIFIED THE ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT CORRECT.

EKS, SPDO

September 21, 2017

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE THIS DATE
WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE ABOVE
BIDS.

U@ At g

Cheryl Godirey September 21, 2017 N




