BID ABSTRACT

Opelika Restoration

Opelika, ALABAMA

IFB # AC-17-B-0013-S

21-Sep-17
General Contractor Base Bid Item A Alternate #1 Alternate #2 Alternate #3 Alternate #4 Alternate #5 Base Bid Item B
A. G. Gaston Construction No Bid
Amity Construction No Bid
Auburn Electrical Construction Co. No Bid
BCS, LLC 3,860,471.00 244,787.00 232,038.00 11362300 $ 8,004.00| $ 63,720.00 | § 180,654.00
Bullard Cock, Inc. 3,781,000.00 256,000.00 335,000.00 128,00000 | $ 27,900.00| $ 64,000.00 | $ 353,000.00
C. W. Smith Decorating Co, LLC No Bid
Carlisle General Contractors No Bid
Carmon Construction, Inc. 4,078,844.00 250,000.00 321,000.00 158,000.00 | § 32,500.00( $ 68,500.00 | $ 404,000.00
Central Contracting, Inc. No Bid
Hale Building Company 4,045,242.00 268,357.00 156,530.00 108,381.00 | $ 67,687.00| $ 47,598.00 | $ 371,302.00
Hollon Contracting LLC 4,287,468.00 280,350.00 564,261.00 165,820.00 | $ 45,000.00( $ 82,360.00 | $ 286,567.00
Hudak Construction No Bid
Hudmon Construction Company, Inc. No Bid
RDT Enterprises, LLC No Bid
Trawick Contractors No Bid
Walters Controls, Inc. No Bid
Whatley Construction LLC 3,649,201.00 252,229.00 209,141.00 116,305.00 | $ 56,213.00| $ 48,564.00 | $ 367,532.00
Wyatt Sasser Construction LLC No Bid

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED AND
READ ALL OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT | HAVE
VERIFIED THE ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT CORRECT.

)77

MARK A. WEEKS, SPDO

September 21, 2017

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE THIS DATE
WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE ABOVE
BIDS.

Chonf dvhreg

Cheryl Godftey Septembér 21, 2017



